
To Share  

DIPS & SPREADS house-made pimento cheese, 
hummus, crudité veggies, grilled pita  

23 

LOBSTER QUESADILLA chihuahua cheese, corn, 
poblano, scallions, avocado crema, chipotle mayo  

26 

BRAVA CHICKEN BITES crispy chicken thighs, 
salsa  brava, key lime cilantro aioli 

18 

SMOKED SWORDFISH DIP* radish, jalapeño, red 
onion, lemon, fried pita 

24 

TUNA POKE NACHOS* crisp wonton, wakame, 
watermelon radish, yum-yum & kabayaki sauces  

24 

CONCH & CORN FRITTERS pickled vegetables,      
calypso hot sauce, green onion  

24 

LOCAL FISH TACOS blackened, avocado, pickled 
cabbage, chipotle mayo, cotija cheese, flour tortilla 

28 

CARNE ASADA TACOS guajillo braised beef short 
rib, queso fresco, onions, cilantro, tomatillo salsa, 
flour tortilla 

25 

Entrées  

BURRATA FLATBREAD piperade, mozzarella, aru-
gula,  balsamic reduction 

25 

TRUFFLE LOBSTER MAC & CHEESE cavatappi, 
four marlin’s cheese sauce, chive  

30 

CATCH OF THE DAY* grilled or blackened, crispy 
fries or side salad, cole slaw, chimichurri 

MP 

Handheld  

FOUR MARLIN’S BURGER* american angus beef, 
aged cheddar, lettuce, tomato, onion, secret sauce, 
brioche bun, choice of side 

add bacon   +3 

26 

SMOKED TURKEY CLUB bacon, tomato, boston 
bibb, avocado, spicy mayo, multigrain, choice of side 

23 

GROUPER “PASTRAMI” REUBEN gouda cheese, 
cabbage slaw, calypso hot sauce, marble rye, choice  
of side 

31 

MOJO CHICKEN SANDWICH bacon, pepper jack 
cheese, lettuce, tomato, bbq aioli, choice of side  

26 

BLACKENED MAHI MAHI piquillo tartar sauce, 
baby arugula, tomato, brioche bun, choice of side  

28 

ISLAND WRAP roasted vegetables, hummus,       
tomato, young spinach, sun-dried-tomato tortilla 

+ add-on protein 

20 

Salad  

FLORIDA COBB steamed lobster, poached shrimp, 
blue crab, romaine, bacon, blue cheese, hard-boiled 
egg, cherry tomato, avocado green goddess        
dressing 

36 

FOUR MARLIN’S leafy greens, baby tomato, pepitas, 
goat cheese, heart of palm, pickled onion, citrus     
vinaigrette 

21 

CAESAR romaine, parmesan cheese, crouton,     
house-made caesar dressing  

18 

Desserts  

KEY LIME PIE whipped sweet cream, key lime zest 15 

HUMMINGBIRD CAKE cream cheese frosting,     
pecan, pineapple 

15 

CHURROS cinnamon sugar, rum caramel sauce,   
nutella 

15 

CHOCOLATE CAKE fresh berries, raspberry coulis, 
house-made whipped cream 

15 

*contains (or may contain) raw or under cooked ingredients. consuming raw or under cooked, meats, poultry, shellfish, or eggs may 
increase your risk of food born illness. There is a risk associated with consuming raw oysters and shellfish. If you have a chronic illness 

of the liver, stomach, or blood, you are at greater risk of illness. Parties of 6 or more are subject to a 18% service charge.  

Sides  

FRENCH FRIES 6 

GARDEN SALAD 6 

ASSORTED TROPICAL FRUIT  6 

CRUDITÉ VEGGIES 6 

chicken 10 shrimp 14 mahi 8 16 tofu 


